75-22 Pest, Termite, and Specialty Services (Inspections, Controls, and Preventions)
Bid Tabulation

Ericka Andrew, Buyer
1 2 3 4
Terminix Commerical Cook's Pest Control Inc. Bay Pest Control Company Sand Mountain Pest
PEST CONTROL SERVICES - BID PRICING Management, LLC
Building: Square Building: Annual Monthly Jro— Monthly Annual Monthly Annual Monthly
Group: | No.: Department Location Fogt.a?: Outside Inspection | Standard Pest (ST Cash Standard Pest | Inspection | Standard Pest | Inspection | Standard Pest
g Perimeter Cost Svcs. Cost P Svcs. Cost Cost Svcs. Cost Cost Sves. Cost
| 1 | General Services 2121 Building 213,000 604] $ 1,464.00 $ 12200 $ - $ 400.00 | No Charge $ 124.00 | $ 0.00 $ 160.00
| 2 | General Services 8th Avenue Service Station 9,000 450] $ 32400 $ 27.00 ] $ - $ 140.00 | NoCharge @' $ 19.00 | $ 0.00  $ 53.00
| 3 | General Services Archives - 1st Bldg 3,500 300] $ 264.00 | $ 22001 $ - $ 35.00] NoCharge ' $ 19.00 | $ 0.00 $ 37.00
| 4 |General Services Archives - 2nd Bldg 5,000 350] $ 264.00 $ 22.00 | $ - $ 35.00 | NoCharge |$ 24.00 | $ 0.00  $ 37.00
Bessemer Courthouse and
! 5 | General Services Annex & Bridge 235,000 80s 46800 $ 39.00 | s - s 18500 | NOChage o 119.00 | $ 000 $ 160.00
| 6 | General Services Bessemer Justice Center 156,000 940l $ 1,10400 $ 92.00 | $ - $ 120.00 | NoCharge @' $ 14400 | $ 0.00  $ 126.00
Birmingham Courthouse &
: 7 General Services Annex 461,000 12600 s 238400 '8 197.00(s - s aos00| NOCM g 1i000fs 000§ 19500
Birmingham Courthouse Deck
! 8 General Services (@ stories) 260,000 80 g 146400 s 12200 | $ - s 7500 | NOChGE g 99.00 | 5 0.00  $ 47.00
Cahaba Heights Sheriff's
: ® | General Services Substation 2,600 22 800 s 19.00 | $ - s 4000 | NOCharge g 34.00 | $ 0.00  $ 42.00
Center Point Multi-Services
' 10 General services Facility 20,500 s 44400 s 37.00 | 5 - s 1s000| Nochaee g 64.00 | s 0.00 | $ 47.00
| 11  General Services Criminal Justice Center 140,000 860l $ 1,04400 $ 87.00| $ - $ 60.00 | NoCharge @ $ 14400 | $ 0.00 | $ 205.00
| 12 General Services Domestic Relations 37,000 562| $ 504.00 $ 4200 $ - $ 75.00 | NoCharge @ $ 29.00 | $ 000 $ 79.00
Family Court & Youth
' General Services Detention Buildings** 138,500 20845 78000 3 65.00 | 5 - s ao000| NOCME g 1s000]s 000 $ 20500
| 14 General Services Forestdale Sheriff’s Substation 3,300 236 3 240.00 | $ 2000 | $ : $ 45.00 No Charge $ 3008 000 | $ 42.00
Gardendale Satellite
| 1 No Ch
5 General Services Courthouse 10,925 0ls 4800 s 2000 | $ -3 75.00 [ NOCMree g 4400 | $ 0.00 3 47.00
| 16  General Services Hoover Satellite Courthouse 10,460 366] $ 348.00 $ 29.00 | $ - $ 50.00 | NoCharge | $ 44.00 | $ 000 $ 47.00
| 17 i i No Ch
General Services MeCalla Sheriff’s Substation 2916 20s 30000 s 25.00 | 5 -3 4500 | NOCharee g 34.00 | $ 0.00 3 42.00
' 18 | General services Mt. Olive Sheriff’s Substation 1,000 19005 24000 s 2000 | $ - s 4000 | NOCharge g 34.00 | $ 0.00 | $ 25.00
Oak Grove Sheriff’s
| 1 X No Ch
® | General Services Substation 1,200 8s 2000 3 20.00 | $ - s a0.00 | NOCharge g 3400 | $ 0.00 '$ 25.00
| 20 | General Services Operations Center 142,000 1616] $ 960.00 | $ 80.00 | $ - $ 150.00 | NoCharge @ $ 54.00 | $ 0.00 $ 101.00
Public Safety
| 21 No Ch
General Services Center/Bessemer** 125,000 85 150000 5 12500]s - s 2e300| MM g 1s000]s 000 $ 13100
Public Safety
! 22 | General Services Center/Birmingham** 225,000 1042l ¢ 150000 § 125008 - s orsoo| NOCME o ug00]s 000 $  158.00
| 23 General Services Tom Gloor Building 51,500 718] $ 540.00 $ 45,00 | $ - $ 100.00 | NoCharge @' $ 59.00 | $ 0.00 | $ 89.00
General Services - Group I: Totals| $ 16,932.00 $ 1,411.00] $ - $ 3,093.00 | $ - $ 1,722.00 | $ 0.00 $ 2,100.00
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PEST CONTROL SERVICES - BID PRICING Terminix Commerical Cook's Pest Control Inc. Bay Pest Control Company S&I;i:;s;z:\atjnlieét
- Buildi_ng: Annual Monthly Monthly Annual Monthly Annual Monthly
Group:  No.: Department Location Buﬂ(:i:lngt. SHIETE Ou_t5|de Inspection | Standard Pest | Antpualc " Standard Pest | Inspection | Standard Pest | Inspection | Standard Pest
ootage P:L'}':;Ztgr Cost Svcs. Cost nspection €08 Svcs. Cost Cost Svcs. Cost Cost Svcs. Cost
I 1 Camp Bessemer Maint. No Charge
Roads and Transportation | Compound (Main Office) 8,864 $ 564.00 | $ 47.00 | $ - $ 50.00 $ 1850 | $ 0.00 $54.00
I 2 Camp Bessemer Maint. No Charge
Roads and Transportation | Compound (Warehouse) 7,500 $ 504.00 $ 42.00 | $ - $ 50.00 $ 1850 | $ 0.00 $50.00
I 3 Camp Bessemer Maint. No Charge
Roads and Transportation  Compound (Fuel Island) 3,264 $ 504.00 | $ 42.00 | $ - $ 20.00 $ 1850 | $ 0.00 $42.00
Camp Bessemer Maint.
1 4 Compound (Traffic Sign No Charge
Roads and Transportation  Shop/Paint Bldg) 4,000 $ 504.00 $ 42.00 | $ - $ 50.00 $ 1850 | $ 0.00 $50.00
I 5 Camp Ketona Highway No Charge
Roads and Transportation  Engineering (Boat House) 1,336 $ 504.00 | $ 42.00 ] $ - $ 40.00 $ 10.60 | $ 0.00 $20.00
Camp Ketona Highway
I} 6 Engineering (Bridge No Charge
Roads and Transportation | Warehouse) 14,040 $ 804.00 | $ 70.00 | $ - $ 50.00 $ 10.60 | $ 0.00 $65.00
I 7 Camp thona Highway No Charge
Roads and Transportation | ="9"neering (Carpenter Shop) 2,016 $ 54000 $ 45.00 | $ - s 45.00 $ 10.60 | $ 0.00 $27.00
Camp Ketona Highway
1 8 Engineering (Highway No Charge
Roads and Transportation | Engineering Bldg.) 8,208 $ 660.00 | $ 55.00 | $ - $ 50.00 $ 1060 | $ 0.00 $50.00
Camp Ketona Highway
I} 9 Engineering (Storage) No Charge
Roads and Transportation | Building 120 $ 240.00 $ 20.00 | $ - $ 20.00 $ 1060 | $ 0.00 $10.00
I 10 Camp Ketona l_\/laint_enace No Charge
Roads and Transportation | COmPund (Main Office) 6,480 $ 60000 $ 5000 | 8 - s 70.00 $ 1650 | 5 0.00 $48.00
Camp Ketona Maintenace
1] 11 Compound (Warehouse/Tire No Charge
Roads and Transportation  Shop) 9,266 $ 660.00 ' $ 55.00 | $ - $ 75.00 $ 16.50 | $ 0.00 $52.00
I 12 Camp Ketona Maintenace No Charge
Roads and Transportation | COmPound (Fuet Island) 108 s 24000 $ 2000 s - s 20.00 $ 1650 | 0.00 $10.00
I 13 Camp Ketona Maintenace No Charge
. Compound (Bunk House)
Roads and Transportation 1,767 $ 420.00 $ 35.00|$ - $ 40.00 $ 16.50 | $ 0.00 $20.00
Camp Ketona Maintenace
1] 14 Compound (Traffic Signal No Charge
Roads and Transportation ' Shop) 12,000 $ 1,500.00  $ 125.00 | $ - $ 50.00 $ 16.50 | $ 0.00 $60.00
Camp Ketona Maintenace
1] 15 Compound (Traffic No Charge
Roads and Transportation | Engineering Bldg) 4,000 $ 540.00 | $ 45.00 | $ - $ 50.00 $ 16.50 | $ 0.00 $50.00
I 16 Camp Ketona M_ain?enace No Charge
Roads and Transportation | ComPound (Traffic Sign Shop) 4,000 $ 54000 $ 4500 | - s 50.00 $ 1650 | 5 0.00 $50.00
Fleet Management (Central
1 17 . No Charge
Roads and Transportation  Shop) 47,917 $ 1,800.00 $ 150.00 | $ - $ 166.00 $ 34.00 | $ 0.00 $78.00
Fleet Management (Bessemer
1 18 . No Charge
Roads and Transportation  Shop) 12,000 $ 564.00 ' $ 47.00 | $ - $ 50.00 $ 34.00]$ 0.00 $60.00
Roads and Transportation - Group II: Totals| $ 11,688.00 $ 977.00] $ - $ 946.00 ] $ - $ 310501 $ 0.00 $796.00
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PEST CONTROL SERVICES - BID PRICING

Building:
Group: [ No.: Department Location EXTIEIEE SETe Ou_t5|de
Footage Perimeter
(Linear)
m 1 Cahaba River WWTP
Environmental Services (Admin. & Lab Bldg) 2,080 302
m 2 Cahaba River WWTP (Maint.
Environmental Services Bldg.) 5,500 276
Cahaba River WWTP
1 3 (Engineering/Smoothing
Environmental Services Filter Bldg.) 2,450 228
m 4 Cahaba River WWTP (Office
Environmental Services Bldg.) 1,716 242
m 5 Five Mile Creek WWTP
Environmental Services (Admin Bldg.) 3,380 249
m 6 Five Mile Creek WWTP (Lab
Environmental Services Bldg.)
m 7 Five Mile Creek WWTP
Environmental Services (Control Bldg.) 283 68
m 8 Five Mile Creek WWTP
Environmental Services (Maintenance Shop) 9,714 397
i o Environmental Services Leeds WWTP (Admin Bldg.) 2,966 260
11l 10 | Environmental Services Leeds WWTP (Lab Bldg.)
m 11 Trussville WWTP (Admin
Environmental Services Bldg.) 3,799 275
1 12 Environmental Services Trussville WWTP (Lab Bldg.)
m 13 Turkey Creek WWTP (Admin
Environmental Services Bldg.) 4,960 346
m 14 Turkey Creek WWTP (Lab
Environmental Services Bldg.)
m 15 Shades Complex WWTP
Environmental Services (Administrative Building) 2,900
m 16 ) ) Shades Complex WWTP -
Environmental Services Barton Laboratory 17,000 812
m 17 ) ] Shades Complex WWTP
Environmental Services (Crew Operations) 2,000
m 18 ) ] Shades Complex WWTP
Environmental Services Dispatch* 7,500 274
Shades Complex WWTP
1 19 (Inspection Survey & Grease
Environmental Services Control Facility) 21,000 452
m 20 ) ) Shades Complex WWTP
Environmental Services (Instrument Facility) 8,800 271
m 21 ) ) Shades Complex WWTP
Environmental Services (Maintenance Shop Garage) 750
m 22 ) ) Shades Complex WWTP
Environmental Services (Maintenance Shop) 1,950
m 23 ) ) Shades Complex WWTP (New
Environmental Services Line Maint. Building) 3,850 488
m o4 Shades Complex WWTP
Environmental Services (Paint Shop) 700
Shades Complex WWTP
1 25 Pump Station— (O & M
Environmental Services Storage)Bldg. 5,000 336
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$

$

$
$

Terminix Commerical

Annual
Inspection
Cost

240.00

336.00

336.00
240.00
336.00
240.00
240.00
600.00

420.00
300.00

480.00
300.00
600.00
300.00
300.00
900.00
300.00

480.00

1,020.00
480.00
300.00
360.00

540.00

300.00

600.00

Monthly
Standard Pest
Svcs. Cost
$ 20.00
$ 28.00
$ 28.00
$ 20.00
$ 28.00
$ 20.00
$ 20.00
$ 50.00
$ 35.00
$ 25.00
$ 40.00
$ 25.00
$ 50.00
$ 25.00
$ 25.00
$ 75.00
$ 25.00
$ 40.00
$ 85.00
$ 40.00
$ 25.00
$ 30.00
$ 45.00
$ 25.00
$ 50.00

Pest Control Services

Cook's Pest Control Inc.

Annual Monthly

Inspection Cost Standard Pest
Sves. Cost

: SR 60.00
: - |8 50.00
: - |8 60.00
: SR 45.00
: - |8 50.00
$ |
: - |8 60.00
’ - |8 120.00
: - |8 50.00
$ N
: - |8 50.00
$ |
: SR 60.00
$ |
: - |8 50.00
: SR 100.00
: SR 50.00
: SR 50.00
2 SR 70.00
2 SR 50.00
2 SR 40.00
2 SR 40.00
2 SR 60.00
: SR 50.00
: SR 50.00

Bay Pest Control Company

Annual Monthly
Inspection | Standard Pest
Cost Svcs. Cost
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge $ 30,00

No Charge

$ 30.00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge $ 30,00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge | $ 30.00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge

$ 30.00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge $ 30.00
No Charge

$ 30.00

Sand Mountain Pest
Management, LLC
Annual Monthly
Inspection | Standard Pest
Cost Svcs. Cost

0.00 $25.00
0.00 $45.00
0.00 $25.00
0.00 $25.00
0.00 $30.00
0.00 $30.00
0.00 $16.00
0.00 $44.00
0.00 $35.00
0.00 $30.00
0.00 $25.00
0.00 $25.00
0.00 $35.00
0.00 $30.00
0.00 $37.00
0.00 $65.00
0.00 $22.00
0.00 $44.00
0.00 $58.00
0.00 $42.00
0.00 $15.00
0.00 $22.00
0.00 $37.00
0.00 $15.00
0.00 $27.00
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Shades Complex WWTP -
1 26 P Station Maint No Charge
Environmental Services ump tation Maintenance 1,925 $ 36000 $ 30.00 75.00 30.00 0.00 $27.00
Shades Complex WWTP
W1 27 Epvironmental Services  (Training Facility) 5,800 35[$ 60000 $ 50.00 50,00 | NO Charge 30.00 0.00 $47.00
Shades Complex WWTP (TV
m 28 No Ch
Environmental Services  Building #2) 4,197 25| $ 600.00 ' $ 50.00 4000 | O 30.00 0.00 $22.00
Shades Complex WWTP (TV
W1 29 environmental Services | Grouting) 5,000 $ 60000 $ 50.00 go.00 | NNO Charge 30.00 0.00 $27.00
1] 30 . . Valley_ C_reek WWTP . No Charge
Environmental Services (Administrative Building) 15,141 397] $ 960.00 $ 80.00 75.00 30.00 0.00 $58.00
Valley Creek WWTP (Bio
W31 environmental Services | Solids Bldg.) 1,900 253§ 30000 | $ 25.00 ap.00 | NoCharge 30.00 0.00 $37.00
Valley Creek WWTP
1] 32 . . N No Charge
Environmental Services (Dewatering Bldg.) 18,250 606] $ 960.00 | $ 80.00 60.00 30.00 0.00 $37.00
Valley Creek WWTP
m | 33 No Ch
Environmental Services  (Electrician Shop) 3315 27| 36000 $ 30.00 T 30.00 0.00 $37.00
1 34 Xglley Q;eel:_wvgg (Former No Charge
Environmental Services ministration Bldg.) 4,200 $ 36000 $ 30.00 50.00 30.00 0.00 $37.00
Valley Creek WWTP
35 crvironmental Services  Maintenance Bldg. 7,777 $ 42000 S 35.00 go.oo | NOCharge 30.00 0.00 $47.00
1 36 . . Village C_reek WWTP No Charge
Environmental Services Construction Shop Bldg. 8,500 $ 420.00 | $ 35.00 40.00 30.00 0.00 $47.00
Village Creek WWTP East
W37 environmental Services  Station 1,925 170l s 24000 20.00 30,00 | NOCharge 30.00 0.00 $37.00
Village Creek WWTP
1 38 . . . . No Charge
Environmental Services Electrical Shop Building* 13,101 484] $ 540.00 $ 45.00 40.00 30.00 0.00 $58.00
0w st s e o
Environmental Services g 5,020 292] $ 360.00 $ 30.00 50.00 30.00 0.00 $37.00
Village Creek WWTP Line
W40 e ironmental Services | Maint. Bldg.* 8,756 406 3 42000  $ 35.00 a0.00 | NoCharge 30.00 0.00 $47.00
Village Creek WWTP
M 41 ironmental Services | Maintenance Shop* 10,581 $ 48000 $ 40.00 s0.00 | O Charge 30.00 0.00 $47.00
Village Creek WWTP New
1 42 . . NV No Charge
Environmental Services Administration Bldg.* 9,441 $ 480.00 | $ 40.00 100.00 30.00 0.00 $47.00
Village Creek WWTP Pipe
m | o4 -1e No Char
% | Environmental Services | Yard Building 5,253 $ 36000 $ 30.00 3500 | NOCharge 30.00 0.00 $37.00
m 24 \Cllllagte Cr:ek \é\ll\:jVTP (Sewer No Charge
Environmental Services onstruction Bldg.) 9,867 $ 42000 $ 35.00 50.00 30.00 0.00 $47.00
m 5 - . Village Creek WWTP (Sonny No Charge
Environmental Services  COE Bldg.) 1,720 $ 24000 $ 20.00 40.00 30.00 0.00 $30.00
m 6 _ _ Village Creek WWTP (Water No Charge
Environmental Services Tower) 19,368 $ 540.00 $ 45.00 75.00 30.00 0.00 $58.00
Village Creek WWTP (West
W47 Environmental Services  Station) 1,925 183|$ 24000 $ 20.00 30.00 | N Charge 30.00 0.00 $32.00
Roads and Transportation - Group Il: Totals] $ 20,808.00 @ $ 1,734.00 2,375.00 | $ - 1,410.00 0.00 $ 1,704.00
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. . Sand Mountain Pest
g I Inc. Bay P |
PEST CONTROL SERVICES - BID PRICING Terminix Commerical Cook's Pest Control Inc. ay Pest Control Company Management, LLC
Building: Square B(;l:tdslizg: Annual Monthly p— Monthly Annual Monthly Annual Monthly
Group: | No.: Department Location Fogt-a 2 Perimeter Inspection | Standard Pest STttn Cash Standard Pest | Inspection | Standard Pest | Inspection | Standard Pest
g (Linear) Cost Svcs. Cost P Svcs. Cost Cost Svcs. Cost Cost Svcs. Cost
v 1 |Information Technology Fairfield (IT Tower) 644] $ 240.00 | $ 20.00 | $ - $ 40.00 | NoCharge | $ 15.00 | $ 0.00  $ 20.00
\Y 2 |Information Technology Forestdale (IT Tower) 728] $ 240.00 | $ 20.00] $ - $ 40.00 | NoCharge |$ 15.00 | $ 0.00 ' $ 20.00
v 3 |Information Technology Gilmore (IT Tower) 719 $ 240.00 | $ 20.00 | $ - $ 40.00 | NoCharge | $ 15.00 | $ 0.00  $ 20.00
\Y 4 Information Technology Linn’s Crossing (IT Tower) 1064] $ 240.00 | $ 20.00] $ - $ 40.00 | NoCharge |$ 15.00 | $ 0.00  $ 20.00
v 5 |Information Technology Oak Mountain (IT Tower) 609] $ 240.00 | $ 20.00 | $ - $ 40.00 | NoCharge | $ 15.00 | $ 0.00  $ 20.00
\Y 6 | Information Technology Palmerdale (IT Tower) 7771 $ 240.00 | $ 20.00] $ - $ 40.00 | NoCharge |$ 15.00 | $ 0.00 ' $ 20.00
v 7 | Information Technology Providence (IT Tower) 884] $ 240.00 | $ 20.00 | $ - $ 40.00 | NoCharge | $ 15.00 | $ 0.00  $ 20.00
\Y 8 |Information Technology Rock Mountain (IT Tower) 702| $ 240.00 | $ 20.00] $ - $ 40.00 | NoCharge |$ 15.00 | $ 0.00  $ 20.00
v 9 Information Technology ~ Ruffner Mountain (IT Tower) 1000 s 24000 $ 20,00 | $ - s 40,00 | NoCharge | g 15.00 | $ 0.00 | $ 20.00
v 10 ' Information Technology Warrior (IT Tower) 644] $ 240.00 | $ 20.00 ] $ - $ 40.00 | NoCharge |$ 15.00 | $ 0.00  $ 20.00
Information Technology IV - Group Totals|] $ 2,400.00 @ $ 200.00 | $ - $ 400.00 | $ - $ 150.00 | $ 0.00 $ 200.00
Grand Total of Groups I through IV: | $ 51,82800]$  4,332200]$ - [$  681400]$ - [$  359%250]$% 0.01[$  4800.00
and A al Tota or Pest & Te e (A al/Mo Quarte ombined Se e $ 91,064.00 | $ 162,775.00 | $ 440,857.00 | $ 57,600.00
d Year Contract P g, Upo al Agreeme $ 91,064.00 | $ 114,588.00 | $ 422,130.00 | $ 57,600.00
d Year Contract P g, Upo al Agreeme $ 91,064.00 | $ 114,588.00 | $ 422,130.00 | $ 57,600.00
otal o ee ea ontract P g po al Agreement i 273,192.00 ] $ 391,951.00 | $ 1,285,117.00 | $ 172,800.00
All three (3) Services Offered -
Both Services - Annual 1st year, | Annual (Visual only no bait w/ | Pest Services Only - No Termite
All three (3) Services Offered - 2nd/3rd Quarterly Termite annual) and Monthly Termite Offered
Annual Termite Inspection Only Services Offered Services Offered
Percentage Discount % Add-On Specialty Services 5% 0% 5% 0%
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75-22 Pest, Termite, and Specialty Services (Inspections, Controls, and Preventions)
Bid Tabulation

Ericka Andrew, Buyer
1 2 3 4
T Camrmil Cook's Pest Contrt?l - *Sentricon Bay Pest Control Company Sand Mountain Pest Management
TERMITE INSPECTIONS AND CONTROL SERVICES - BID PRICING Installation* LLC
Building: Annual uarterl Annual Annual
i . . Building: Outsidg Annual Termite QN || D)7 Termite © Cost g Raciuld Termite QUL Monthly Cost | Termite QUEE || (17
Group: | No.: Department Location . . Cost Cost . . Cost . Cost : . Cost Cost
Square Footage | Perimeter | Inspection Cost . . Inspection | Services*after . Inspection . Services Inspection . .
. Services | Services Services Services Services | Services
(Linear) Cost one (1) year Cost Cost
| 1 General Services 2121 Building 213,000 604 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 302.00 $ - $ 504.00 $0.00 NO BID = NOBID
| 2 General Services 8th Avenue Service Station 9,000 450 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 |$ 111100 $ 79.00 $ - $ 225.00  $ - $ 375.00 $0.00 NOBID  NOBID
| 3 | General Services Archives - 1st Bldg 3500 300 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 559.00 $ 70.00 $ - $ 150.00 @ $ - $ 250.00 $0.00 NO BID = NOBID
| 4 | General Services Archives - 2nd Bldg 5000 350 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 739.00 $ 70.00 $ - $ 175.00  $ - $ 292.00 $0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
| 5 | General Services Bessemer Courthouse and Annex & Bridge 235,000 870 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 | $ 1,081.00 $ 105.00 @ $ - $ 435.00 | $ - $ 725.00 $0.00 NOBID | NOBID
| 6 | General Services Bessemer Justice Center 156,000 940 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 |$ 1,951.00 $ 179.00  $ - $ 470.00 $ - $ 784.00 $0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
| 7  General Services Birmingham Courthouse & Annex 461,000 1260 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 |$ 2,341.00 $ 221.00 $ - $ 630.00  $ - $ 1,050.00 $0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
1 8 General Services Birmingham Courthouse Deck (9 stories) 260,000 580 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID | $ 290.00  $ - $ 484.00 $0.00 NOBID  NOBID
| 9 General Services Cahaba Heights Sheriff's Substation 2,600 212 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 619.00 $ 70.00 $ - $ 106.00  $ - $ 177.00 $0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
1 10 General Services Center Point Multi-Services Facility 20,500 776 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID $ - $ 388.00 $ 647.00 $0.00 NOBID  NOBID
R R S Criminal Justice Center 140,000 860 $400.00 5000 | sogo [MelCIWIn g - s - |s 43000 $  717.00| $000  NOBID NOBID
| 12 | General Services Domestic Relations 37,000 562 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 129100 $ 102.00 | $ - $ 281.00 $ - $ 469.00 $0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
| 13 General Services Family Court & Youth Detention Buildings** 138,500 2084 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 |$ 428200 $ 403.00 $ - $ 1,042.00 $ - $ 1,737.00 $0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
| 14 | General Services Forestdale Sheriff’s Substation 3,300 236 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 499.00 $ 70.00 $ - $ 118.00  $ - $ 197.00 $0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
| 15 | General Services Gardendale Satellite Courthouse 10,925 430 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID $ - $ 21500 $ - $ 359.00 $0.00 NOBID = NOBID
| 16 | General Services Hoover Satellite Courthouse 10,460 366 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID $ - $ 183.00  $ - $ 305.00 $0.00 NOBID = NOBID
| 17 | General Services McCalla Sheriff’s Substation 2,916 230 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 499.00  $ 70.00 $ - $ 115.00 | $ - $ 192.00 $0.00 NO BID = NOBID
| 18 General Services Mt. Olive Sheriff’s Substation 1,000 190 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 499.00 $ 70.00 $ - $ 95.00 $ - $ 159.00 $0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
| 19 | General Services Oak Grove Sheriff’s Substation 1,200 204 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 559.00  $ 70.00 $ - $ 102.00  $ - $ 170.00 $0.00 NO BID = NOBID
| 20 | General Services Operations Center 142,000 1616 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 | $ 3,671.00 $ 303.00 $ - $ 808.00  $ - $ 1,347.00 $0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
| 21 General Services Public Safety Center/Bessemer** 125,000 788 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 |$ 3,621.00 $ 207.00 $ - $ 39400 $ - $ 657.00 $0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
| 22 | General Services Public Safety Center/Birmingham** 225,000 1042 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 274500 $ 340.00 $ - $ 521.00 $ - $ 869.00 $0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
| 23 General Services Tom Gloor Building 51,500 718 $400.00 $0.00 $000 |$ 1,817.00 $ 127.00  $ - $ 359.00 $ - $ 599.00 $0.00 NOBID ' NOBID
General Services - Group I: Total] $ 9,200.00  $ - $ - $ 2788400 $ 2556.00 $ - $ 7,834.00 $ - $ 13,065.00 | $ - NO BID | NOBID
TERMITE INSPECTIONS AND CONTROL SERVICES - BID PRICING Terminix Commerical Cook's Pest Control Bay Pest Control Company S Mountalr:jeét Management
Building: Annual Annual Annual
i i . Building: Outsidg Annual Termite Quarterly | Monthly Termite Quarterly Monthly Termite Quarterly Monthly Cost | Termite Quarterly: | Monthly
Group: | No.: Department Location . . Cost Cost . . Cost . Cost . . Cost Cost
Square Footage | Perimeter | Inspection Cost : : Inspection | Cost Services : Inspection . Services Inspection . :
. Services | Services Services Services Services | Services
(Linear) Cost Cost Cost
1] 1 Camp Bessemer Maint. Compound (Main Office) $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 | $ 781.00 $ 73.00 $ - $ 188.00 | $ o $ 314.00 $0.00 NOBID  NOBID
Roads and Transportation 8,864
1] 2 Camp Bessemer Maint. Compound (Warehouse) $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 | $ 1,009.00 $ 70.00 $ - $ 173.00 | $ o $ 289.00 $0.00 NOBID  NOBID
Roads and Transportation 7,500
1] 3 Camp Bessemer Maint. Compound (Fuel Island) $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 | $ 589.00  $ 70.00 $ - $ 115.00 | $ o $ 192.00 $0.00 NOBID  NOBID
Roads and Transportation 3,264
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I 4 Camp Bessemer Maint. Compound (Traffic Sign $400.00 $0.00 | $000 |$ 76900 $ 7000 $ $ 12600 $ $ 21000 $000 | NOBID A NOBID
Shop/Paint Bldg)
Roads and Transportation 4,000
1 5 (H:;'EE)KEtO”a Highway Engineering (Boat $400.00 $0.00 | $000 |$ 55000 $ 7000 $ $ 7300 $ $ 12200 $000 | NOBID A NOBID
Roads and Transportation 1,336
I 6 g;':ymite‘;”a Highway Engineering (Bridge $400.00 $0.00 | $000 |$ 104100 $ 9600 $ $  237.00 $ $  39500| $000 | NOBID  NOBID
Roads and Transportation 14,040
1 7 gﬁ:;;’ Ketona Highway Engineering (Carpenter $400.00 $0.00 | $000 |$ 49900 $ 7000 $ $ 9000 $ $  15000| $000 = NOBID A NOBID
Roads and Transportation 2,016
Camp Ketona Highway Engineering (Highway shared with
1] 8 Engineering Bldg.) $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 46 $ - $ $ 180.00  $ $ 300.00 $0.00 NOBID | NOBID
Roads and Transportation 8,208
I 9 gj”":j‘?n';em”a Highway Engineering (Storage) $400.00 $000 | $000 |$ 58000 § 7000 $ $ 2200 $ $ 3700 $.00 NOBID NOBID
Roads and Transportation 120
10 g‘;‘fri';z)'(em”a Maintenace Compound (Main $400.00 $000 | $000 |$  78.00 $ 7300 $ $ 16000 $ $  26700| $.00 NOBID NOBID
Roads and Transportation 6,480
o1 Camp Ketona Maintenace Compound $400.00 $000 | $000 |$ 168100 $ 10000 $ $ 19200 $ $  32000| $00 NOBID NOBID
(Warehouse/Tire Shop)
Roads and Transportation 9,266
Camp Ketona Maintenace Compound (Fuel
] 12 Roads and Transportation  Island) 108 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 769.00 $ 70.00 $ $ 20.00 $ $ 34.00 $0.00 NO BID | NOBID
13 _ Camp Ketona Maintenace Compound (Bunk $400.00 $000 | $000 |$ 79900 $ 7000 $ $ 8500 $ $  14200| $00 NOBID NOBID
Roads and Transportation | House) 1,767
Camp Ketona Maintenace Compound (Traffic
] 14 Roads and Transportation  Signal Shop) 12,000 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 739.00 $ 70.00 $ $ 220.00 $ $ 367.00 $0.00 NOBID | NOBID
15 _ Camp Ketona Maintenace Compound (Traffic $400.00 $000 | $000 |$ 73900 $ 7000 $ $ 14000 $ $  23400| $00 NOBID NOBID
Roads and Transportation | Engineering Bldg) 4,000
Camp Ketona Maintenace Compound (Traffic
1] 16 Roads and Transportation  Sign Shop) 4,000 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 799.00 $ 70.00 $ $ 140.00  $ $ 234.00 $0.00 NO BID | NOBID
1] 17 |Roads and Transportation | Fleet Management (Central Shop) 47,917 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 | $ 821.00 | $ 77.00 $ $ 572.00 $ $ 954.00 $0.00 NOBID | NOBID
1] 18 |Roads and Transportation | Fleet Management (Bessemer Shop) 12,000 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 |$ 769.00 | $ 70.00  $ $ 22000  $ $ 367.00 $0.00 NOBID | NOBID
Roads and Transportation - Group 11: Totals| $ 7,200.00  $ - . $ 1373300 $ 1,259.00[ $ $ 2,953.00 $ $ 4,928.00 - $ - $ -
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TERMITE INSPECTIONS AND CONTROL SERVICES - BID PRICING

Terminix Commerical

Cook's Pest Control

Bay Pest Control Company

Group:

No.:

© 0 N o o~ W NP

N =
2 W N B O

15

16

17
18

19
20
21

22

23
24
25

26

27
28
29

30
31

Department

Environmental Services
Environmental Services

Environmental Services
Environmental Services
Environmental Services

Environmental Services
Environmental Services

Environmental Services
Environmental Services

Environmental Services
Environmental Services

Environmental Services
Environmental Services

Environmental Services
Environmental Services

Environmental Services
Environmental Services
Environmental Services

Environmental Services
Environmental Services

Environmental Services
Environmental Services

Environmental Services
Environmental Services

Environmental Services

Environmental Services
Environmental Services
Environmental Services
Environmental Services

Environmental Services
Environmental Services

Prepared By E.Andrew 09.09.22

Location

Cahaba River WWTP (Admin. & Lab Bldg)

Cahaba River WWTP (Maint. Bldg.)

Cahaba River WWTP (Engineering/Smoothing
Filter Bldg.)

Cahaba River WWTP (Office Bldg.)

Five Mile Creek WWTP (Admin Bldg.)

Five Mile Creek WWTP (Lab Bldg.)

Five Mile Creek WWTP (Control Bldg.)

Five Mile Creek WWTP (Maintenance Shop)
Leeds WWTP (Admin Bldg.)

Leeds WWTP (Lab Bldg.)

Trussville WWTP (Admin Bldg.)

Trussville WWTP (Lab Bldg.)

Turkey Creek WWTP (Admin Bldg.)

Turkey Creek WWTP (Lab Bldg.)

Shades Complex WWTP (Administrative
Building)

Shades Complex WWTP - Barton Laboratory

Shades Complex WWTP (Crew Operations)
Shades Complex WWTP Dispatch*
Shades Complex WWTP (Inspection Survey
& Grease Control Facility)
Shades Complex WWTP (Instrument Facility)
Shades Complex WWTP (Maintenance Shop
Garage)

Shades Complex WWTP (Maintenance Shop)

Shades Complex WWTP (New Line Maint.
Building)

Shades Complex WWTP (Paint Shop)
Shades Complex WWTP Pump Station — (O & M
Storage)Bldg.
Shades Complex WWTP - Pump Station
Maintenance

Shades Complex WWTP (Training Facility)
Shades Complex WWTP (TV Building #2)
Shades Complex WWTP (TV Grouting)

Valley Creek WWTP (Administrative Building)
Valley Creek WWTP (Bio Solids Bldg.)

Building:
Square Footage

2,080
5,500

2,450
1,716

2,966

3,799

4,960

2,900

17,000
2,000
7,500

21,000
8,800

750
1,950

3,850
700

5,000

1,925
5,800
2,800
5,000

15,141
1,900

Building:
Outside
Perimeter
(Linear)

302
276

228

242
249

68

397

260

275

346

812
274

452
271

488

336

345
259

397
253

Annual Termite
Inspection Cost

$400.00
$400.00
$400.00

$400.00
$400.00

$400.00
$400.00
$400.00
$400.00
$400.00
$400.00
$400.00
$400.00
$400.00

$400.00

$400.00

$400.00
$400.00

$400.00
$400.00
$400.00

$400.00

$400.00
$400.00
$400.00

$400.00

$400.00
$400.00
$400.00

$400.00
$400.00

Quarterly | Monthly

Cost Cost
Services | Services
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00

Termite Services

Annual
Termite
Inspection
Cost

$ 889.00
$ 529.00
$ 829.00
$ 739.00
$ 499.00
shared with

admin
$ 529.00

$ 1,551.00

$ 499.00
shared with
admin
$ 529.00
shared with
admin
$ 499.00
shared with
admin

$ 639.00

1,745.00

889.00
499.00

725.00
499.00
591.00

© B B AL B

$ 709.00

$ 1,037.00
$ 559.00
$ 679.00

$ 1,591.00
$ 499.00
$ 709.00
$ 1,165.00
$ 521.00
$

529.00

Quarterly
Cost Services

115.00
105.00
86.00

94.00
70.00

70.00

133.00

98.00

105.00

125.00

LR = A AR - - - < < R < s

©

82.00

142.00

70.00
70.00

79.00
70.00
70.00

@ B B P L B

©“

70.00

85.00
70.00
70.00

126.00

70.00
70.00
89.00

72.00
70.00

R < R - R - R < < - R e R - -

©

© B B AL B

©

© B B A B

Monthly

Cost
Services

Annual
Termite
Inspection
Cost
151.00
138.00
114.00

121.00
124.00

100.00

34.00
198.00
130.00
100.00
137.00
100.00
173.00
100.00

LR - R - A AR - - R - R IR - AR - R - L 2

©

108.00

406.00

90.00
137.00

226.00
135.00
57.00

©“ B B P L B

©“

87.00

244.00
55.00
168.00

87.00

172.00
129.00
150.00

198.00

¥ B B P B

126.00

Quarterly
Cost
Services

@ B B B B B B B B BB B B P
'

© B B P B B
'

©
'

Monthly Cost
Services

252.00
230.00
190.00

202.00
208.00

167.00

57.00
331.00
217.00
167.00
230.00
167.00
289.00
167.00

@B B B B B B B B B BB B B P

©

180.00

677.00

150.00
229.00

377.00
226.00
95.00

© B B P L B

©

146.00

407.00
92.00
280.00

145.00

288.00
216.00
250.00

331.00

©“ B B P B

211.00

Sand Mountain Pest Management
LLC
Annu_al Quarterly | Monthly
Termite
. Cost Cost

Inspection . .

Services | Services
Cost
$0.00 NOBID  NOBID
$0.00 NOBID = NOBID
$0.00 NOBID  NOBID
$0.00 NOBID  NOBID
$0.00 NOBID  NOBID
$0.00 NOBID = NOBID
$0.00 NO BID = NOBID
$0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
$0.00 NO BID = NOBID
$0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
$0.00 NOBID  NOBID
$0.00 NOBID  NOBID
$0.00 NO BID = NOBID
$0.00 NOBID = NOBID
$0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
$0.00 NOBID  NOBID
$0.00 NOBID  NOBID
$0.00 NO BID = NOBID
$0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
$0.00 NO BID = NOBID
$0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
$0.00 NOBID = NOBID
$0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
$0.00 NO BID @ NOBID
$0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
$0.00 NOBID  NOBID
$0.00 NO BID = NOBID
$0.00 NO BID @ NOBID
$0.00 NO BID  NOBID
$0.00 NOBID  NOBID
$0.00 NOBID  NOBID
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11 32 Environmental Services Valley Creek WWTP (Dewatering Bldg.) 18,250 606 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 1,211.00 $ 108.00  $ - $ 303.00 $ - $ 505.00 $0.00 NO BID = NOBID
1] 33 Environmental Services Valley Creek WWTP (Electrician Shop) 3,315 327 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 |$ 699.00  $ 70.00 $ - $ 163.00  $ - $ 273.00 $0.00 NOBID | NOBID
Valley Creek WWTP (Former Administration
11 34 Environmental Services Bldg.) 4.200 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 499.00  $ 70.00 $ $ 130.00 | $ $ 217.00 $0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
] 35 | Environmental Services Valley Creek WWTP Maintenance Bldg. 7,777 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 | $ 830.00 | $ 75.00 $ - $ 172.00  $ - $ 295.00 $0.00 NOBID | NOBID
11 36 . . Village Creek WWTP Construction Shop Bldg. $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 649.00  $ 70.00 $ - $ 185.00 | $ - $ 309.00 $0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
Environmental Services 8,500
] 37 | Environmental Services Village Creek WWTP East Station 1,925 170 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 |$ 769.00  $ 70.00 $ - $ 85.00 $ - $ 142.00 $0.00 NOBID | NOBID
. ) S i i
11 38 Environmental Services Village Creek WWTP Electrical Shop Building 13.101 484 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 1,11900 $ 85.00 $ $ 242.00 $ $ 404.00 $0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
w3 : Village Creek WWTP Former Administration $400.00 $0.00 | $0.00 [$ 49900 $ 7000 $ - [$ 14600 $ - ' $  24400| $000 = NOBID NOBID
Environmental Services Bldg.* 5,020 292
11 40 Environmental Services Village Creek WWTP Line Maint. Bldg.* 8756 406 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 813.00 $ 71.00 $ - $ 203.00 $ - $ 339.00 $0.00 NO BID = NOBID
11 41 Environmental Services Village Creek WWTP Maintenance Shop* 10,581 $400.00 $0.00 $000 |$ 1,831.00 $ 142.00  $ - $ 205.00 $ - $ 342.00 $0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
11 42 . . Village Creek WWTP New Administration Bldg.* $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 73700  $ 75.00 $ - $ 195.00  $ - $ 325.00 $0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
Environmental Services 9,441
1] 43 Environmental Services Village Creek WWTP Pipe Yard Building 5,253 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 | $ 151100 $ 124.00  $ - $ 152.00  $ - $ 254.00 $0.00 NOBID | NOBID
no 44 . . Village Creek WWTP (Sewer Construction $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 |$ 72000  $ 7400 | $ - |$s 19800 5 - |$ 33000 $0.00 = NOBID  NOBID
Environmental Services Bldg.) 9,867
11 45 Environmental Services Village Creek WWTP (Sonny COE Bldg.) 1,720 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 619.00 $ 70.00 $ - $ 88.00 $ - $ 147.00 $0.00 NOBID @ NOBID
n 46 Environmental Services Village Creek WWTP (Water Tower) 19,368 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 |$ 619.00 @ $ 70.00 $ - $ 293.00 $ - $ 489.00 $0.00 NOBID | NOBID
11 47  Environmental Services Village Creek WWTP (West Station) 1925 183 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 589.00 $ 70.00 $ - $ 91.00 $ - $ 153.00 $0.00 NOBID = NOBID
Roads and Transportation - Group Il: Totals] $  18,800.00 $ - $ - $ 34,400.00 $ 3,690.00 $ - $ 7,146.00 $ - $ 11942001 $ - $ - $ -
.. i ., Sand Mountain Pest Management
TERMITE INSPECTIONS AND CONTROL SERVICES - BID PRICING Terminix Commerical Cook's Pest Control Bay Pest Control Company LLC
Building: Annual Annual Annual
i i . Building: Outside Annual Termite QUEEL || LACni)7 Termite Quarterly LAl Termite QUL Monthly Cost | Termite QUELELY || AEni)7
Group: | No.: Department Location . . Cost Cost . . Cost . Cost ; . Cost Cost
Square Footage | Perimeter | Inspection Cost X X Inspection | Cost Services X Inspection . Services Inspection X X
. Services | Services Services Services Services | Services
(Linear) Cost Cost Cost
v 1 | Information Technology Fairfield (IT Tower) 644 $400.00 $ - $ - $ 499.00 | $ 70.00 | $ - $ 130.00  $ - $ 165.00 $0.00 NO BID | NOBID
\% 2 |Information Technology  Forestdale (IT Tower) 728 $400.00 $ - $ - $ 499.00 | $ 7000 $ - $ 64.00 $ - $ 165.00 $0.00 NOBID | NOBID
v 3 | Information Technology | Gilmore (IT Tower) 719 $400.00 $ - $ - $ 499.00 | $ 70.00 | $ - $ 75.00 | $ - $ 165.00 $0.00 NO BID | NOBID
\% 4 |Information Technology | Linn’s Crossing (IT Tower) 1064 $400.00 $ - $ - $ 499.00 | $ 70.00 @ $ - $ 75.00  $ - $ 165.00 $0.00 NOBID | NOBID
v 5 | Information Technology | Oak Mountain (IT Tower) 609 $400.00 $ - $ - $ 499.00 | $ 70.00 | $ - $ 75.00 | $ - $ 165.00 $0.00 NO BID | NOBID
\% 6 | Information Technology Palmerdale (IT Tower) 777 $400.00 $ - $ - $ 499.00 | $ 70.00  $ - $ 75.00 $ - $ 165.00 $0.00 NOBID | NOBID
v 7 | Information Technology | Providence (IT Tower) 884 $400.00 $ - $ - $ 499.00 | $ 70.00 | $ - $ 75.00 | $ - $ 165.00 $0.00 NO BID | NOBID
\% 8 |Information Technology  'Rock Mountain (IT Tower) 702 $400.00 $ - $ - $ 499.00 | $ 70.00  $ - $ 75.00  $ - $ 165.00 $0.00 NOBID | NOBID
v 9 | Information Technology | Ruffner Mountain (IT Tower) 1000 $400.00 $ - $ - $ 499.00 | $ 70.00 | $ - $ 75.00 | $ - $ 165.00 $0.00 NO BID | NOBID
\% 10 |Information Technology  'Warrior (IT Tower) 644 $400.00 $ - $ - $ 499.00 | $ 7000  $ - $ 75.00 $ - $ 165.00 $0.00 NOBID | NOBID
Information Technology IV - Group Totals] $ 4,000.00 | $ - $ - $ 4,990.00 $ 700.00 $ - $ 794.00 $ - $ 1,650.00 | $ - $ - $ -
Grand Total of Groups I through IV: [ $  39,200.00 | $ - [s - $ 8100700]$ 820500]$ - |$ 18727.00 [$ 3158500]% - Is - Is -
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75-22 Pest, Termite, and Specialty Services (Inspections, Controls, and Preventions)

Bid Pricing Submittal - Add-On Speciality Services
Ericka Andrew, Buyer

SPECIALITY SERVICES - BID PRICING

1

2

3

4

Terminix Commerical

Cook's Pest Control

Bay Pest Control Services

Sand Mountain Pest
Management LLC

Percentage Discount:
Add-On Specialty Services:

Based on the quote(s) provided during a service call 5% 0% 5% 0%
and/or inspections, as needed. (Bats, Bee Hives,
Possums, etc.) Removal, Trapping and Baiting etc.

REQUIRED FORMS

Notice of Intent to Respond Yes, No Signature Yes Yes Yes

Debarment Statement Yes Yes Yes Yes

Non-Collusion Affidavit Yes Yes Yes Yes

Experience Statement Yes Yes Yes Yes

Equal Employment Opportunity Cert. Form Yes Yes Yes Yes

Affidavit of Contractor Yes Yes Yes Yes

Signature Page Yes Yes Yes Yes

Addendum(s) Yes Yes Yes Yes

Price Sheets Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes - Regions Bank Yes, Hancock Whitney Cashier's
Bid Bond Cashier's_ Check Check#0000063518 in the
#5506983993 in the amount amount of $3,091.85
No of $8,138.75 No

CONTACT INFORMATION

Terminix Commerical

Address: 2081 Alton Road Ste. A Birmingham, AL 35210 | Contact: Ladarius Smith | Phone: 205.641-0870 |
Email: Lsmith5@terminix.com

Cook's Pest Control

Address: P.O. Box 59214 Birmingham, AL 35259-9214 | Contact: Seth Green | Phone: 205.290.0890 | Fax: 205.290.0120 |

Email: birmingham.ccookspest.com

Bay Pest Control Services

Address: 6820 Washington Avenue Ocean Springs, MS 39564 | Contact: Bruno Milanese | Phone: 228.875.8908 |
Fax: 228.875.1627 | Email: mail@baypestcontrol.net

Sand Mountain Pest Management LLC

Address: 694 AL Hwy 75 N Albertville, AL 35951 | Contact: Max Bruce| Phone: 256.891.7400| Fax: 256.891.8993 |

Email: max@sandmtnpest.com
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